
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2017/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 1

L. A. BILL NO. XX OF 2017.

A BILL

further to amend the Indian Penal Code, 1860 and the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973, in their application to the State of Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Indian Penal Code, 1860
and the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 in their application to the State
of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted
in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India, as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. This Act may be called the Indian Penal Code and the Code of
Criminal Procedure (Maharashtra Amendment) Act, 2017.

45 of
1860.

2 of
1974.

Short title.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEò 30(2)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®úúú, ̈ ÉÉSÉÇõ 31, 2017/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 3, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 57

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Indian Penal Code and the Code of Criminal Procedure Code (Maharashtra
Amendment) Bill, 2017 (L. A. Bill No. XX of 2017), introduced in the Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly on the 31st March 2017, is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--57-------1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2017/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 19392

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE INDIAN PENAL CODE, 1860.

2. In section 332 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 in its application to
the State of Maharashtra (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the
said Code”), for the words “ three years” the words “ five years” shall be
substituted.

3. In section 353 of the said Code, for the words “ two years” the
words “ five years ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE CODE OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE, 1973.

4. In section 309 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, in its
application to the State of Maharashtra (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “ the Code of Criminal Procedure”), after the existing proviso,
the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“ Provided further that, when the enquiry or trial relates to an
offence under section 332 or 353 of the Indian Penal Code, the inquiry
or trial shall, as far as possible be completed within a period of six
months from the date of filing of the charge sheet.”.

5. In the First Schedule to the Code of Criminal Procedure, under
the heading “I.-OFFENCES UNDER THE INDIAN PENAL CODE”,—

(i) for the entry relating to section 332, the following entry shall
be substituted, namely :—

“332 Voluntary Imprison- Cognizable Non- Court of
causing ment bailable Session.”;
hurt to for five
deter years, or
public fine, or
servant both.
from his
duty.

(ii) for the entry relating to section 353, the following entry shall
be substituted, namely :—

“353 Assault Imprison- Cognizable Non- Court of
or use of ment bailable Session.”.
criminal for five
force to years, or
deter a fine, or
public both.
servant
from
discharge of
his duty.

Amendment
of section 332
of 45 of 1860.

45 of
1860.

Amendment
of section 353
of 45 of 1860.

45 of
1860.

Amendment
of section 309

of 2 of 1974.

Amendment
of First

Schedule  of
2 of 1974.

2 of
1974.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2017/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS.

Section 332 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 provides for punishment
for the offence of voluntarily causing hurt to deter public servant from
his duty with imprisonment of either description for a term which
may extend to three years or with fine or with both. The offence
under section 333 of the said Code provides for punishment for voluntarily
causing grievous hurt to deter public servant from his duty with
imprisonment of either description for a term which may extend to
ten years and also with fine. Section 353 of the said Code provides
for punishment for offence of assault or criminal force to deter a public
servant from discharge of his duty with imprisonment of either description
for a term which may extend to two years, or with fine or with both.

Part I of the First Schedule of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973 (2 of 1974) provides that the offence under the said section 333
shall be triable by a Court of Session and that the offences under
said section 332 shall be triable by a Magistrate of the First Class
and section 353 shall be triable by any Magistrate.

It has been brought to the notice of the State Government that
there is an increase in the number of assaults to deter a public servant
from discharging his duties. The data available with the State Government
shows that during the period 2011 till August 2016, about 17,682 cases
have been registered under the said sections 332, 333 and 353.

As the existing provisions regarding punishment under sections
332 and 353 are not effective to ensure the public servants and adequately
safeguard them in the discharge of their duties, it is expedient to
enhance the punishment for the offences under the said sections 332
and 353 and to provide that the said sections 332 and 353 be tried
by a Court of Sessions, as in the case of offence under section 333.

It is therefore considered expedient to amend sections 332 and
353 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 and section 309 and the First
Schedule to the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, in their application
to the State of Maharashtra, suitably.

2. The Bill seeks to achieve the above objectives.

Mumbai, DEVENDRA FADNAVIS,

Dated the 29th March, 2017. Chief Minister.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT
PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH
GOSAVI.


